
vests a right in such person, so long as the person remains the beneficiary of
any of the funds established by section 3307.14 of the Revised Code, to
receive the allowance, annuity, pension, or benefit at the rate fixed at the
time of granting the allowance, annuity, pension, or benefit. Such right shall
also be vested with equal effect in the beneficiary of a grant heretofore made
from any of the funds named in section 3307.14 of the Revised Code.

(B)(1) The state teachers retirement system may suspend the benefit of a
person receiving a benefit under section 3307.58 or 3307.59 of the Revised
Code, a disability benefit under section 3307.63 or 3307.631 of the Revised
Code, a survivor benefit under section 3307.66 of the Revised Code, any
payment under section 3307.352 of the Revised Code, a benefit under
section 3307.60 of the Revised Code as a beneficiary, or a benefit under an
STRS defined contribution plan under either of the following circumstances:

(a) The retirement system has good cause to believe that the person
receiving benefits is incapacitated and no other person has authority to act or
receive benefits on the person's behalf.

(b) The retirement system learns that the person receiving benefits is
missing, and no person provides evidence satisfactory to the system that the
person is alive and is entitled to receive benefits.

(2) Benefits shall resume on presentation of evidence satisfactory to the
board that the person is no longer incapacitated or is alive and entitled to
receive benefits. Any missed payments shall be paid in a single lump sum
payment.

(3) A benefit suspended under division (B)(1)(b) of this section shall be
terminated on presentation to the board of a decree of presumed death.
Notwithstanding section 2121.04 of the Revised Code, the termination shall
be retroactive to the date the benefit was suspended.

Sec. 3307.46. Whenever the limits established by section 415 of the
"Internal Revenue Code of 1986," 100 Stat. 2085, 26 U.S.C.A. 415, as
amended, are raised, the state teachers retirement board may increase the
amount of the pension, benefit, or allowance of any person whose pension,
benefit, or allowance payable under section 3307.58, 3307.59, 3307.63,
3307.631, or 3307.67 of the Revised Code or a an STRS defined
contribution plan established under section 3307.81 of the Revised Code
was limited by the application of section 415. The amount of the increased
pension, benefit, or allowance shall not exceed the lesser of the amount the
person would have received if the limits established by section 415 had not
been applied or the amount the person is eligible to receive subject to the
new limits established by section 415.

Sec. 3307.47. (A) If a person is paid any benefit or payment by the state
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